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Summary 
Five Imperial College students went to the Quimsa Cruz mountain range in Bolivia to climb 
new rock routes and explore the area, looking for rock climbing potential. The group climbed 
eleven routes, ten of which are believed to be new routes. Eight of the routes were purely 
rock routes, two were long scrambling ‘alpine’ routes, and one was a mixed route. Several 
areas showing good new rock route potential were documented. The expedition was a very 
enjoyable experience for all members and the Quimsa Cruz area is highly recommended as 
a destination for future rock climbing expeditions. There is a high density of climbable rock, 
with a huge amount of potential for new routes on high quality rock; in addition the weather is 
generally very reliable. 
 
 
Introduction 
The idea for this expedition came about from a desire to climb new rock routes in a remote 
location. The Quimsa Cruz area was suggested to us by some UKClimbing.com forum users 
who had visited the Quimsa Cruz range before and found that there was a lot of potential in 
the area. Details for these people can be found in the contacts section. Our general aim was 
to climb new rock routes, however we also set some specific aims, and these were not all 
possible. One of our aims was to climb a new route on Nevada Saturno; however, after a 
snow storm early in the trip, the mountain did not come back into condition and had a 
significant snow covering for the rest of our time in the area. Another of our aims was to climb 
the walls near Nevada Tras Cuarenta; however these turned out to be chossy slopes. 
Instead we visited the valley to the north of our intended climbing area, where we found a 
huge amount of north-facing (sunny) rock – with great potential for new routes. 
 
Routes Completed (please see map for area details, coordinates are provided for Google 
Earth or satellite navigation use): 
 
1. 'Lower Torrini' area - E1 5b, HVS 4c, VS 4c.  
Latitude: 16°50'1.28"S Longitude: 67°30'23.93"W 
 
2. The Big Wall area - no projects completed. 
Latitude: 16°50'13.38"S Longitude: 67°31'0.95"W 
 
3. 'Mid Torrini' area - E5 6b, E2 5c. 
Latitude: 16°49'59.69"S Longitude: 67°30'14.56"W 
 
4. Mixed Slab area -Scottish III/4. 
Latitude: 16°50'25.14"S Longitude: 67°30'6.37"W 
 
5. Diablos area - VS 4c. 
Latitude: 16°50'8.64"S Longitude: 67°29'39.30"W 
 
6. Laguna Blanca Slab area - E1 5b, AD-.  
Latitude: 16°50'43.05"S Longitude: 67°29'39.75"W 
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7. Opposite Saturno area - E3 5c. 
Latitude: 16°51'4.37"S Longitude: 67°29'25.38"W 
 
 
8. The Ridge area - PD+. 
Latitude: 16°51'13.79"S Longitude: 67°30'33.28"W 
 
 

 
 
Base camp:   Latitude: 16°50'49.74"S Longitude: 67° 30'46.97"W 
Advanced camp 1: Latitude: 16°50'47.57"S Longitude:  67°29'26.48"W 
Advanced camp 2: Latitude: 16°49'58.07"S Longitude:  67°30'16.03"W 
Big wall camp: Latitude: 16°50'18.13"S Longitude: 6 7°31'5.16"W 
Viloco:  Latitude: 16°52'27.57"S Longitude: 67°29'5 4.27"W 
 
 
 
Expedition Members 
Hal Watts, 3rd year Imperial College Mechanical Eng ineering  
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Hal has been an outdoor enthusiast for many years. This started with trekking trips from the 
age of fourteen. He has organised and participated in long treks in the Swiss Alps, the Lake 
District and various locations around France. He Climbs several times a week and has 
experience of many UK crags. He has also been on dedicated climbing trips to France, Spain 
and the Swiss and French Alps. He has undertaken several long rock routes at altitude up to 
TD grade. He also speaks French, which makes things easier when in the Alps.  
 
 
 
 
Markus Roggen, 3rd year Imperial College Chemistry  

 
Markus joined the army for his year of compulsory national service. He was one of only two 
people out of 30 applicants who were accepted to join the Special Forces Mountaineering 
(Hochgebirgsjaegerzug Edelweiss) where he was trained in mountain warfare, 
mountaineering and mountain rescue. The training was focused on physical fitness (running, 
cross country skiing, ski touring and climbing) and all important techniques (rope work, 
rescue in all mountain situations and military equipment). He preserved his close ties to the 
mountains after leaving the army and studying chemistry at Imperial College by working as 
skiing instructor in the winter holidays and as a climbing instructor in the summer. Markus 
was president of the Imperial College Mountaineering Club for 2005/2006. He is qualified as 
a Tyrolean skiing instructor and has undergone German army mountain rescue and survival 
training.  
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Bernard Lam, 4th year Imperial College Chemical Eng ineering  

 
Bernard has been climbing since a very young age and has gained climbing experience from 
around the globe. He has scaled many world classics in Hong Kong, the US, the UK, 
Scotland, Spain, France, and Italy and has several alpine seasons under his belt. He is 
experienced in all forms of climbing including multi pitch traditional, aid climbing, and big 
walling, in addition to sport climbing and bouldering. He is competent on rock, snow, waterfall 
ice as well as on mixed ground (to alpine TD, Scottish Winter IV, ice WI5, aid C2). Most 
recently he has undertaken several big wall expeditions in Yosemite. Bernard is currently 
working on multiple projects with international climbers on the exploration and development 
of new climbing crags and potentials in Hong Kong. Bernard is studying chemical 
engineering in Imperial College London and is presently in his final year.  
 
Virgil Scott, 3rd year Imperial College Mechanical Engineering  

 
Virgil has a broad experience climbing large multipitch routes across Europe. His passion for 
climbing has brought him to France, Italy, Spain, Croatia and the Alps. Recently he visited 
Arco, Italy, climbing routes up to 650m, f6c. Virgil is familiar with a wide variety of rock and 
has climbed at crags around Britain up to E3. In the Alps he has undertaken multipitch rock 
routes up to grade TD and climbed peaks up to 4200m.  
 
 
 



 7 

Ben Withers, 1st year PhD Imperial College Physics  

 
An outdoor enthusiast since a young age, Ben, over the last five years has been taking part 
in many disciplines of climbing. Last summer he was part of the Imperial College Chogolisa 
expedition to climb a 7665m mountain in the Karakoram. As part of a four man team 
negotiating a 400m ice fall to reach a camp at 6000m he is well acquainted with cold 
weather, ice and high altitudes. He has also been climbing rock for many years, traditional 
climbing around the UK on weekends and going on longer sport climbing trips in Europe. In 
the summer of 2004 he climbed long big wall routes in Yosemite, including C1 aid techniques 
and 3000+m alpine rock ascents. Ben has frequented the French and Swiss Alps climbing up 
to alpine grade TD, WI5, and visits Scotland every winter and climbs Scottish V. 
 
 
Expedition Diary 
 
Sunday 24 June 
We met in the morning in the Imperial Mountaineering Club equipment stores to distribute the 
gear and pack our rucksacks. We had a flight from Gatwick to Madrid in the afternoon. We 
had spent an extra £30 each for sporting baggage allowance and this meant we could bring 
and extra bag each and increased the weight allowance from 20kg to 32kg per person. We 
arrived at Madrid in the early evening and it was still scorching hot outside the airport. We set 
up camp under an escalator and slept, waiting for our flight the next day. 
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Monday 25 June 
We had previously contacted Aerosur (the flight operator we used to get to Bolivia) and 
requested additional weight allowance and they granted us 45kg per person. We had printed 
off the letter from the UK branch of Aerosur as proof of the additional weight allowance, but 
when we showed this letter to the employees at the Aerosur desk they pretty much laughed 
at it – it seemed it would not be sufficient proof. We gradually spoke to more and more senior 
employees until finally we were granted permission (if only because they were concerned 
about the queue growing behind us). However this turned out to be of no use anyway 
because Easyjet had not been so accommodating in granting extra weight allowance. 
 
From Madrid we flew to Santa Cruz, via a pit stop in Brazil, to our surprise the flight was 
actually with Air comet – apparently Aerosur are not permitted to land in Europe. 
In Santa Cruz airport we ate at Subway and realized that things in Bolivia are generally pretty 
cheap. We spent the night on some comfy benches on the upper floor near some TVs that 
wouldn’t stop playing Bolivian Panpipe music all night long. 
 

Sleeping in 
Madrid 
airport under 
an escalator. 
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Tuesday 26 June 
We flew to La Paz from Santa Cruz with Aerosur. We found the air was noticeably thinner as 
soon as we stepped out of the plane. José Camarlinghi from Andean Summits arrived 
punctually just as we were collecting our luggage. He drove us to Hostel Naira, where we 
stayed for four nights. We spent the afternoon finding our way around the shops of La Paz. 
 

 
 

Breakfast in 
Madrid 
airport. 

Relaxing in 
the Hotel 
after 
arriving. 
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Wednesday 27 June 
We aimed to spend our time relaxing and acclimatising in La Paz as we had just come from 
sea level to 3800m (although a week previously two of us spent 10 days in the alps, 
spending several days at 3800m or higher in an attempt to prepare). Thankfully no one 
experienced any severe altitude related problems throughout the trip. We visited the local 
supermarket – Ketal, conversation with shop attendants was limited by our near non-existent 
Spanish skills. 

  
 
Thursday 28 Jun 
After scoping out the best shopping areas the day before we were ready to start supply 
gathering. We had calculated our exact food needs the night before but it wasn’t until we had 
it loaded into shopping trolleys that we realised what an enormous amount food we were 
buying – everything had been judged on the basis of ‘it’s better to have a little too much than 
to run out of food in the middle of nowhere’. Shop assistants pointed and laughed. We 
decided to stop at two full trolleys and buy the rest the next day. Walking back up the hill to 
the hotel would have been nigh on impossible with the shopping and with our wheezing lungs 
so we took a taxi, Hal sat in the front seat and later realised that the seat had a puddle with a 
worrying smell. 
 
Friday 29 June 
This was the final day of shopping and acclimatization in La Paz. We picked up the rest of 
the shopping from Ketal and bought some canvas sacks, a trowel and a wire brush from the 
streets markets. The sacks were for packing the food, the trowel and wire brush were for 
cleaning climbs. We had previously been in email contact with a local climber called Gonzalo 
Jaimes. It turned out that he was living next door to our hotel so we paid him a visit. He was 
very friendly and helpful, but with our poor Spanish skills, communication involved lots of 
hand gestures and puzzled repetition. He advised us on where we could find areas that had 
seen little climbing and had good quality rock. 

Downtown 
La Paz at 
night. 
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Saturday 30 June 
We were picked up by Ivan Blanco from Andean Summits at 8am. A seven hour trip in a 
couple of Landrover Defenders brought us to the Rió Kuchu Macoya, in the valley below 
Laguna Blanca. After two hours on paved asphalt the road turned into a rough dirt track. The 
track was narrow and appeared to have almost no passing points. Occasionally our driver 
had to slow to a halt and engage the differential lock to get over the tricky sections. We swept 
around tight hairpins, disturbingly close to sheer drops. We traversed several turquoise lakes 
and passed through a number of small farming and mining settlements, some of them 
abandoned and decaying. The valley of the Kuchu Macoya appeared very suddenly, 
presenting us with the sheer cliffs of Nevada Saturno and the surrounding peaks. We set up 
base camp on the planes near the river. 
 

Street 
market in La 
Paz. 
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Sunday 1 July 
On the first day our plan was to go for a short walk – exploring the nearby area. We didn’t 
want to push our luck with the altitude by doing anything too strenuous. We followed the river 
up the valley, and then branched off north to the Col leading to the next valley in which we 
would later put our second advanced camp. Standing on top of the col gave a stunning view 
of the next valley, exposing the enormous south faces on the opposite side of the valley. It 
was oozing with soaring crack-lines, hundreds of metres long reaching striking pinnacle 
summits, no doubt most, if not all of them, are unclimbed because they do not get much sun 
compared to the mass of rock opposite. We checked for mobile reception and found that 
there was two to three bars of signal but this was for ‘limited services’ – we presumed this 
meant emergency calls only. From the col we could also see Illymani – the highest mountain 
in Bolivia. After spending some time enjoying the views at the col we scrambled to summit of 
the peak to the east of the Col. 
 
Monday 2 July 
In the morning Ben, Hal and Markus made a trip to Viloco to use the landline to call home. In 
the evening we carried bivouac gear for three nights to the east of Laguna Blanca near the 
base of Nevada Saturno. On the way up the valley we met some miners coming down from 
the mines on the south side of the valley. They wore dark cotton clothing, with either a 
woollen hat or a baseball cap and carried rucksacks with thin cord for straps. Each morning, 
at around 8am they would walk past our base camp, about an hour and a half from Viloco up 
to the mines, whilst we would barely out of bed until sunrise (9:30am) because it was so cold 
until then. They were hardy and jovial – they always greeted us cheerfully and asked about 
what we were doing or where we were going. 

Base camp 
near the 
banks of the 
Rio Kuchu 
Macoya. 
Nevada 
Saturno is 
visible on 
the right. 
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Tuesday 3 July 
We split up into two groups, Bernard and Ben set off to the north to find a climb near the col 
next to Saturno. Hal, Markus and I set off east to take a look at the south side of Saturno and 
the surrounding area. There appeared to be several good lines up the south side of Saturno, 

Laguna 
Blanca with 
Nevada 
Saturno in 
the distant 
background. 

Establishing 
our first 
advanced 
camp on the 
plateau 
above 
Laguna 
Blanca 
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however since they were all in the shade we decided to attempt a line on the north facing 
slabs opposite Saturno. We inspected the faces and found several attractive lines, a couple 
of overhanging crack-lines to the east, some blank vertical slabs to the west, and up the 
middle was a large rightward curving crack, this looked to be the easiest line, and since it 
was our first climb we decided it would be best not to push ourselves too much. As it turned 
out we did push ourselves too much, we had totally misjudged the top pitch and it turned our 
to be an exciting section of steep, dirt-filled crack, as we were not really in a position to clean 
it, the climb turned into a constant struggle against the flow of dirt down the crack. The dirt 
and shrubs would gradually slide down the crack and so the climbing involved attempting to 
move faster than the dirt was sliding. Stopping to catch your breath would give you an 
alarming feeling of being in sinking sand – as your hands and feet would begin to move 
downwards, so we called this route E-dirt (E3 5c, 3 pitches, 140m). 
 

 
 

The topo for 
E-dirt, E3 5c, 
3 pitches, 
140m. 
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Ben and Bernard found a climb to the north-west of Saturno, a long scramble (PD) where 
everything was loose. Markus, Hal and I finished our climb in the afternoon and returned to 
base camp because of problems with the stoves, leaving our climbing gear at the Laguna 
Blanca camp. We later found that the petrol we were using was very dirty and was clogging 
up the MSRs, so we started filtering the fuel through a teabag lining – this helped quite a lot. 
Having spoken to Ben and Bernard on the radio it was clear that it would be very late before 
they would return. They finished their route late in the afternoon, just before dark, and 
returned to base camp just before midnight. 

Pitch 3, the 
crux pitch of 
E-dirt. 
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Ben on the 
long 
scramble to 
the north-
west of 
Saturno. 

Ben higher  
on the long 
scramble to 
the north-
west of 
Saturno. 
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Wednesday 4 July 
This was a rest day; we slept at base camp with the intention of going back to the Laguna 
Blanca camp the next day. In the afternoon the weather became gradually windier. We 
cleaned clothes, sorted out the gear and sat around eating tinned fruit. 
 

 
 
Thursday 5 July 
We moved up to the Laguna Blanca camp early in the morning. Markus and I explored the 
area to the north and north-west of Laguna Blanca. We planned to do a route on the slabs to 
the north of the lake but upon inspection it appeared excessively dirty and had evidence of 
being climbed so instead we continued further west and then north up a gulley to check out 
the wall that joined the ridge parallel to the next valley. Bernard and Ben explored the slabs 
below the headwall to the north-east of Laguna Blanca scrambling up a narrowing gulley until 
it became too technical for walking poles. Hal was unwell and rested at camp. 
 

Sorting out 
gear at base 
camp. 
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Friday 6 July 
We had an early start to attempt a very attractive line up the slabs to the east-northeast of 
Laguna Blanca. Markus and I climbed this and it turned out to be a four pitch climb with 
beautiful crack sections (E1 5b, 120m). However, several pieces of in-situ gear were found 
which suggests this was not a first ascent. It would be possible to continue this climb to the 
summit of a choice of pinnacles. We decided not to climb further as the point reached after 
four pitches was the logical end to the aesthetic line, and based on the amount of in-situ gear 
found up to that point it would not be a first ascent. In the evening some small clouds began 
to appear, up to this point the weather had been totally cloudless, and warm enough to climb 
in a base layer during the day (if the climb was on a sunny face). The difference between sun 
and shade temperatures was remarkable, entering the shade felt like walking into the frozen 
foods department of a supermarket. 

Ben i n the 
gulley below 
the headwall 
to the North-
East of 
Laguna 
Blanca. 
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Topo for the 
route on the 
slabs to the 
east-
northeast of 
Laguna 
Blanca. 
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Saturday 7 July 
We returned to have a rest day at base camp. Ben, Hal and Markus went to Viloco to make 
phone calls. The clouds grew over the course of the day and the weather deteriorated. There 
was significant snowfall through the night and most of the higher ground was covered in 
snow. 
 

 

Markus 
seconding 
on the final 
pitch. 
 

Snowfall on 
the peaks to 
the North of 
base camp. 
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Sunday 8 July  
Climbing was not possible due to the snow. Bernard and I explored the valley to the north by 
walking to the Col that leads to what we called ‘Torrini’ (perhaps not the true name). Torrini 
looked stunning but already had many established routes on it. Ben and Hal explored ‘the big 
wall’ area to the north-northwest of base camp. The big wall was one of the most inspiring 
pieces of rock we found out there. It was 400-500m of vertical (sometimes overhanging) rock. 
We decided we had to attempt it. 
 

Snowfall on 
the base 
camp. 
 



 22 

 
 

 
 
Monday 9 July 
There was more snow, hail and wind throughout the day. We played cards and read books in 
the tents. And built a snowman. We also realised that some kind of rodent was nibbling on 
our cereals and chocolate so we ended up hanging all our food from bushes and boulders. 
 

The big wall.  
 

The wall we 
called ‘Torrini’ 
(distant centre-
right). The Pico 
Penis is the 
smaller of the 
prominent 
pinnacles on 
the left. 
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Tuesday 10 July 
The weather improved and the sun came out occasionally in-between the clouds. Hal, 
Markus and I carried gear to the base of the big wall and returned to base camp. Bernard 
and Ben climbed a mixed route (grade III/4) on the slabs near the Col that lead to the next 
valley to the north-west of base camp. 
 

 
 
 

Ben on the 
approach to the 
mixed route. 
 

The snowman.  
We used a 
helmet for the 
nose, walking 
poles for arms, 
tin cans for 
eyes, a frying 
pan for a hat, 
and a little 
green trowel for 
other 
anatomical 
detail. 
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Wednesday 11 July 
Hal and I attempted and retreated three lines on the big wall, the wall turned out to be very 
loose and deceptively steep, difficult and cold, with snow and ice on many holds. All three 
lines looked fairly straightforward but as soon as we stepped onto them we found the angles 
of the holds and formation of the rock somehow forced us to lean away as though on a 
severe overhang. The amount of loose rock was overwhelming; the majority of holds were 
loose enough to remove with a moderate pull. Rock that seemed solid at first would then 
move readily when pulled from a slightly different direction. If the rock had been solid the wall 
would have been superb, steep climbing, with very large holds and good gear. However, 
instead it was steep with very few solid holds and the constant stress of a potential fall onto 
bad protection. Occasionally we encountered a short section of solid rock – these sections 
had very good quality climbing. And this was what encouraged us to continue. We did not 
have any success on the first day but found a promising line of weakness that we would 
pursue the next day. We returned to base camp in the evening. Ben and Bernard rested at 
base camp after completing a mixed route the day before. 
 

 
 
Thursday 12 July 
Hal and I climbed 35m on the big wall, following the line of weakness up a diagonal crack 
that we found on the previous day. The first pitch was climbed in mountain boots as there 
was a significant amount of snow and ice. We set up an anchor after 25m, equalising 5 
pieces of gear. The next pitch was cut short when we encountered an overhanging section 
that was startlingly loose. We spent a little over 30 minutes clearing loose rock from a small 
platform to enable a solid sling belay below this section. We had to stop clearing loose rock 
eventually when we realised that we were gradually destroying the platform that we were 
sitting on – the rock did not seem to get any more solid regardless of how deep we dug. We 
studied the options from our position and decided to try and traverse rightwards then move 
up on a leftward leaning line of weakness. However this would have to wait until the following 
day. We abseiled down and left the ropes to ascend the next day and then bivouacked next 

The big wall 
with topo 
marking lines. 
The three 
purple lines are 
the initial failed 
attempts. The 
Red line shows 
the final 
attempted line. 
The first blue 
dot marks our 
first sling 
anchor, the 
second marks a 
bolt placement. 
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to the lake near the base of the wall. Markus, Ben and Bernard traversed the big ridge (PD+), 
starting south-west of base camp. 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 
Friday 13 July 

Virgil  warming 
his fingers on 
the big wall. 
This was one of 
the initial failed 
lines.  

Markus 
scrambling up 
the big ridge 
(PD+). 
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It took an entire day for Hal and I to traverse 8m in an attempt to find a line of weakness on 
the overhanging section on the big wall. At every stage we would reassess the possibilities in 
terms of finding the best line of weakness with the least loose rock, traversing slightly, then 
attempting to climb diagonally up and left, then up and right, then straight up, failing that we 
would traverse further rightwards and repeat the process. We climbed the traverse in 
mountain boots to avoid cold toes. Eventually we could not go any further when we could not 
find gear placements, so we placed a bolt by hand, whilst hanging from two marginal BD 
micro nuts, in order to retreat from the position and to leave a solid anchor to ascend to the 
next day. Bernard, Ben and Markus climbed a short icefall to the east of base camp. 
 

 
 
 
Saturday 14 July 
Markus, Ben and Bernard climbed an existing bolted route on Torrini. Hal and I ascended to 
the bolt and attempted to make some progress from there. There appeared to be several 
options, either traverse right and follow a flake system leftwards or trend slightly leftwards 
and up to a small ledge or head diagonally leftwards to a section of less steep rock. By the 
end of the day we had tried all of the options, each one taking an extraordinary amount of 
time. Due to the loose rock each move required excavation, cleaning and the testing of many 
holds. Placing gear was even more time consuming, most usable holds would take a 
moderate pull – but not the pull of a fall, so finding a good placement required more time. We 
resorted to a ‘safety in numbers’ idea placing gear at almost every opportunity. In spite of this 
we were not really willing to push ourselves as we didn’t trust the gear; getting passed that 
crux section (the terrain appeared to ease off around 15m higher) would require bold 
climbing on loose rock with the possibility of gear ripping. We discussed alternative tactics 

Hal ascending 
the fixed rope to 
the first anchor.  
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and decided that we could no longer pursue the objective in the same manner so we 
abseiled from the anchor (consisting of 7 equalised parts, including a bolt). 
 
We considered looking for an easy way to the summit then abseiling down from the top, 
cleaning each pitch and slinging (or bolting) anchors. In the evening, we walked up to the 
ridge on the west to see if we could find a way up, but there was no straightforward way. 
 

 
 
 
Sunday 15 July 
Hal walked up the gulley to the east of the big wall to see if there was a way to the summit 
from there whilst I retrieved the gear from the big wall (leaving one bolt and one piece of 
abseil cord).  There was no simple way to the top so we returned to base camp. Markus, Ben 
and Bernard went to the Sunday market in Viloco to pick up some bread and bottled juice 
drink. 
 
Monday 16 July 
We all carried bivi gear to make a camp in the next valley (north – see map). Once we had 
set up the bivi spot we checked out the surrounding rock. There was a lot of it, and all of it 
was north-facing so it received sunlight for most of the day, which was a nice change. 
Unfortunately there was no running water nearby so we had to melt snow for water, the snow 
was full of grit so the water had an interesting texture. 
 
Tuesday 17 July 

The West face 
of the big wall.  
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Bernard and I climbed a five pitch E1 5b (230m) which we named ‘La Cueva Cómoda’ on the 
wall we came to know as ‘lower Torrini’. Markus and Ben climbed two routes, one HVS 4c (3 
pitches, 120m) called ‘Motivationsriss’ on the lower Torrini and an E2 5c (3 pitches, 120m) 
that Markus named ‘LaLiLu’ in the ‘mid Torrini’ area. Hal was bruised by loose rock whilst 
approaching the climb so could not climb. 
 

 
 

  
 

(right)   
‘Lower Torrini’ 
with a topo of 
La Cueva 
Cómoda (E1 5b, 
230m, 5 pitches)  
 
(left) 
Motivationsriss 
(HVS 4c, 120m, 
3 pitches) 

(right)  
‘Mid Torrini’ 
with a topo of 
LaLiLu (E2 5c, 
120m, 3 pitches) 
 
(left) 
‘Quimsa Arete’ 
V1 boulder 
problem 
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Wednesday 18 July 
Hal and I inspected, cleaned and practiced on top-rope the top pitch of a potential line in the 
mid Torrini area. As we had entered the valley we had all noticed a particularly striking piece 
of rock, so we decided to try and find out if it would be climbable. It was clear that the hardest 
pitch would be the top, and the top was fairly accessible from the other side of the valley. So 
we decided to abseil down from the top and check it out. It was a 20m slab that appeared to 
have no natural protection, but had a many small crystals protruding from its surface, like 
miniature ‘chicken-head’ style holds. The climbing was some of the highest quality we had 
ever experienced, immaculate, solid granite, with a beautifully flowing sequence of moves. It 
was the kind of climbing where you feel ‘in the zone’ after the first move. We found two gear 
placements, both of them shallow nut placements in small flake-like grooves. Unfortunately 
the higher of these crumbled away when pulled upon because it was held in by lichen only. 
The lower placement looked as though it might hold a fall, but would easily lift out with an 
upward pull. We discussed the possibility of placing a bolt, but decided against it, as it wasn’t 
really necessary because the crux was low. Instead we settled upon placing a size four cam 
side-runner near the top – which would protect the final couple of moves. The pitch involved 
a well protected, short, bouldery crux section followed by about 15m delicate slab. So as to 
avoid a high factor fall we decided that the belayer would abseil from the anchor to a ledge 
about 20m lower and set up another anchor to belay from, this would reduce a potential 
factor-two fall to a less than factor-one fall. I practiced the crux moves a couple of times, then 
climbed the entire pitch twice on top rope. Markus, Ben and Bernard climbed a four pitch VS 
4c (200m) on lower Torrini. 
 

Virgil on 
Quimsa Arête, 
V1 boulder 
problem. 
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Thursday 19 July 
Hal and I set off to climb the line we had looked at the day before. Ben, Bernard and Markus 
rested at advanced camp. The crux pitch went smoothly, but the diagonally rising crack-line 
traverse turned out to be harder than expected and was also filled with dirt and moss. About 
half way across I had to stop and clean it out as it was getting hard to see because of all the 

Topo on Mid 
Torrini of ‘La 
Manera Dura’ 
(E5 6b, 150m, 4 
pitches). 

Markus on 
lower Torrini 
(VS 4c, 200m, 4 
pitches) 
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moss falling into my eyes. At one point I turned away form the wall to spit out some dirt, this 
unfortunately landed right on Hal. 
 

 
 

 
 

Virgil on the 
third pitch of La 
Manera Dura. 

Crimping on the 
crystals at the 
start of the crux 
section. 
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Friday 20 July 
We all returned to base camp with most of the equipment and rested for the remainder of the 
day. Ben and Markus went into Viloco to make some calls. In the evening Markus and 
Bernard set up an advance camp in the Cuernos Del Diablos area. 
 
Saturday 21 July 
Ben, Hal and I collected the remainder of the gear from the advanced camp in the next valley 
and returned to base camp. Markus and Bernard climbed a three pitch VS 4c near Cuernos 
Del Diablo and returned to base camp in the evening. 
 

Nearing the top 
of the final 
pitch. 
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Sunday 22 July 
We rested at base camp, made preparations to leave, and packed gear and food. Andean 
Summits’ jeeps arrived in the evening. As it was our last day we decided to indulge in some 
pancakes, made by Bernard ‘Pancake Master’ Lam. We melted the remainder of our 
chocolate and had it on the pancakes. We bought about 12kg (in total) of a variety of different 
chocolates from the supermarket, but they all had a distinct earthy taste, kind of like eating 
dirt. However, once it was melted it tasted superb. 
 

Bernard on a 
route near 
Cuernos Del 
Diablo. 
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Monday 23 July 
We packed the tents and sleeping gear. Loaded all the gear into the jeeps and left at around 
8:30am. We arrived in La Paz by around 1:30pm. We had different drivers on this journey 
and they drove like they were in the WRC so the journey time was slightly less than 
expected. 
 
Tuesday 24 July 
We rested and recuperated in La Paz. 
 

 
 
Wednesday 25 July 
We flew to Santa Cruz, and then the connecting flight to Madrid was delayed by a day. So we 
slept in Santa Cruz airport. 
 

Dark chocolate 
melted onto hot 
pancakes. 

The most 
effective way to 
rest and 
recuperate in La 
Paz: Eli’s Ice 
Cream Parlour. 
This ice cream 
cost just over 
£1. 
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Thursday 26 July 
We moved to a hotel that Aerosur offered for us in Santa Cruz. We returned to the airport at 
3pm for a 4:30pm flight. We boarded the aircraft at 5:30pm. But the aircraft had technical 
problems, Hal asked one of the flight attendants and found out that the aircraft was not 
pressurising. It was delayed until 7:30pm. 
 
Friday 27 July 
We arrived in Madrid at around 3pm, rebooked our Easyjet flights (for £25 each) from Madrid 
to Gatwick and flew at 5:30pm to Gatwick.  
 
 
 

Administration and Logistics 
 
Finance 
We would like to thank the following people and organisations for their kind support, without 
their help the expedition would not have been possible: 
 
Sir Richard Sykes  
Imperial College London  
Mount Everest Foundation   
British Mountaineering Council   
First Ascent   
PHD Designs   
Rab  
Terra Nova 
 
 
Payments £ Receipts £ 
Medical training   480.00 Grants 6225.00 
Flights 4110.67 Personal contributions 3069.19 
Equipment & Food 4703.52   
    
    
    
 9294.19  9294.19 

 
 
Travel 
Flights were arranged through a German travel agent that offered us the cheapest flights we 
could find. However, this turned out to be more hassle than it was worth as they later 
increased their prices to something similar to what we had been offered by STA Travel. In 
addition, their flight left from Madrid, so we had to book a separate flight to Madrid rather then 
leaving directly from London to Bolivia. In hindsight, STA Travel would have been a better 
choice. We would not recommend flying with Aerosur if at all possible as we found them 
unreliable (both of our flights were delayed, the return flight was delayed by over 24hrs). 
 
We booked all of our Jeep transport with Andean Summits. They were always on time and 
were very friendly and helpful. They also organised our airport transfers and arranged our 
hotel bookings. 
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Food  
We bought all of our supplies from Ketal supermarket in La Paz. They had a good selection 
and the employees were helpful. Our main sources of carbohydrates were pasta, rice, 
quinoa, cereals and dried mash. The pasta was terrible and turned into a slimy soup no 
matter how it was cooked; we found it hard to eat even after coming down from a long route, 
feeling half starved. The rice was also not great. In hindsight we would buy more cereals, like 
porridge oats, and processed toasted cereals such as honey puffs. Also, we would 
recommend buying a small amount of any carbohydrate and trying it out before buying 15kg 
of it. We bought 125 sachets of Kriss energy drink which proved very popular. As we were 
not going to have to carry our food supplies for any long distance, we opted to buy 100 eggs, 
8kg of fresh cheese, and many cans of tinned fruit and vegetables. 
 
First Aid  
Three of us completed Wilderness First Aid Training at the RGS in London. This was a very 
enjoyable course and we highly recommend it. There is even a student bursary available 
(which we successfully applied for) which gives a significant discount. 
 
We purchased most of our medical supplies (altitude drugs, painkillers, re-hydration sachets 
etc.) from Nomad. We bought an Outdoor pursuits first aid kit from the First Aid Warehouse 
online store. 
 
Drinking water was generally filtered (using an MSR Miniworks) and then either boiled or 
purified with iodine tablets or droplets. However, at some stages one or two members drank 
water that was filtered only and found no ill effects. 
 
Equipment 
We generally climbed with a large selection of cams; I cannot say enough good things about 
climbing with a full set of Black Diamond Camalots. I usually climb with a mixed up set of 
worryingly cheap, Eastern European cams – they work fine, but they don’t even come close 
to the smooth action, wide camming range and ease of placement of the Camalots. Tricams 
and Aliens were also frequently used. Wallnuts and BD Swedges were our nuts of choice, 
and they were brilliant as always, what never failed to impress us was the omnipotent 
versatility of the number 6 Wallnut. It seemed to fit everywhere and was used on almost 
every pitch of every climb we did. 
 
 
Future climbing potential 
During our time in Quimsa Cruz we found a lot more evidence of climbing than we had 
expected. Areas such as the north-west face of Cerro Torrini are pretty much sport crags and 
there is almost no potential for new routes there.  
 
The area that has suitable rock (granidiorite) is not that big and the other rock in the area is 
extremely loose and brittle. We have indicated the area that we believe to be granidiorite on 
the map in the introductory section (all red areas). The granidiorite that we did climb on was 
very good quality. The rock itself was quite clean but the cracks were generally pretty dirty 
and required a certain amount of cleaning. 
 
I would suggest that most of potential for new rock routes is on the south faces. It is pretty 
cold on there even during the day and they may be more suitable for winter style ascents. 
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There is a large wall, circa 500m, about 2km north north-east of Laguna Blanca; we called 
this the Big Wall (see map). There is a fairly good path leading past the base of the wall and 
a small lake bellow it that can be used as a base camp. The wall is made of some composite 
rock and is extremely loose (however we never saw any rock fall). The wall never gets any 
sun so it is quite cold. We attempted what we thought would be the easiest line up the face 
but we could not find a route through the overhangs in the middle of the face. If the rock on 
this route was solid it would make an incredible climb. 
 

 
 
As far as we know there are no routes on this face, this was also confirmed by local climber 
Gonzalo Jaimes. I would suggest that this is one of the few if not the only unclimbed face of 
this size in the area and would make a great objective for a team that doesn’t mind the cold 
and is willing to aid. Abseiling down the route and cleaning it may be the most sensible 
approach to take. 
 
Despite being one of the most photogenic peaks in the area Nevada Saturno is generally a 
pile of choss. The ‘normal’ route appears to be a very steep pile of scree. The only side that 
has solid rock is the west side and even this appears to have some very loose sections near 
the top. The topos that can be seen below were obtained from Gonzalo Jaimes and three 
French climbers that we met. The most attractive unclimbed feature on the mountain is a 
300m finger on the west face that can be seen in the photo. This would make and incredible 
route but would almost certainly have to be aid climbed and might be free climbable after a 
lot of bolting and would go at a high grade. 
 
There is also the possibility of putting up a very long route on the south-west corner of the 
mountain up a crack system leading to the higher slab sections. This was something we 
considered as a main objective during our expedition, however after snowfall it took over 10 
days to be in condition again due to the little amount of sun that it receives. 

The Big Wall. 
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Directly north of Laguna Blanca is a face of around 300m (see photo, most left hand face) 
that appeared to have only one route on it. The face has a break about half way up which 
provides a walk off. The face is solid and has many crack lines on it but would require a fair 
amount of cleaning. The upper section appeared to offer better climbing than the bottom and 
it may be worth starting from the break. Either start would require climbing on dirty, mossy 
rock. 

Nevada 
Saturno. Red 
lines mark 
existing 
routes as 
described by 
Gonzalo 
Jaimes and a 
French 
group that 
we met in 
the area. 
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North of Laguna Blanca was a wall we nick named the “Head Wall” it’s a very steep face 
about 250m high which is pretty cold and would require a winter style approach. The 
approach to the face would be quite an undertaking and would require ascending around the 
back of the peak to the north-west of Laguna Blanca and continuing east until the base of a 
large snow slope is reached. This would then have to be climbed to reach the base of the 
face. As far as we could find out there are currently no routes on this face. 
 

 
 
As can be seen in the photo above there are several large granite spires, on the north side of 
valley to the north of the Kuchu Macoya valley, that still catch enough early sun to come in 
condition quickly after bad weather. These faces have some very attractive crack lines 
however I have no information about what has been climbed on these faces and we never 

The slabs 
North of 
Laguna 
Blanca. The 
red line 
marks a 
route that 
appeared to 
have been 
climbed. 

The south -
west wall of 
the valley to 
the north of 
the Kuchu 
Macoya 
Valley. 
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got very close to them. I would imagine that the other sides of these would receive a lot of 
sun and may provide a good area for future expeditions to explore. 
 
On the north of Cuernos del Diablo is a large face which was some of the cleanest rock that 
we saw in the area and appears to have potential for many new routes of around 200-250m 
in length, topping out very close to 5000m.  
 
 
Endnote 
The expedition was a very enjoyable experience for all members and we would highly 
recommend the Quimsa Cruz area as a destination for future rock climbing expeditions. 
There is a high density of climbable rock, with a huge amount of potential for new routes on 
high quality rock, and the weather is generally very reliable. If you are planning to visit the 
area please do not hesitate to contact us – we will gladly provide you with information. The 
compilers of this report and the members of the expedition agree that any or all of this report 
may be copied for the purposes of private research. 
 
 
Note for sponsors  
If you wish to use any photos for promotional purposes please get in touch and we will supply 
you with original high resolution images. More images can be found on our website at 
www.quimsacruz2007.co.uk 
 
 
Contacts 
Cambridge Quimsa Cruz Expedition 2006 - a previous expedition to the same area, we 
spoke to Ronan Kavanagh who was very friendly and provided some good info.  
http://www.bolivia2006.co.uk/ 
 
University College London,Quimsa Cruz, Bolivia 2004 - the UCL trip has some very good info 
on their site.  
http://www.quimsacruz.info/ 
 
Andean Summits - Very friendly tour company that we used for jeep transport to Viloco and 
airport transfers.  
http://www.andeansummits.com/ 
 
Hostel Naira - The hotel that we stayed at in La Paz, good service and fairly comfortable. 
http://www.boliviahostels.com/hotels-hostels-in-lapaz/naira.html 
 
Gonzalo Jaimes - A very friendly and helpful local climber and mountain guide. Advised us 
on climbing in the Quimsa Cruz range.  
http://www.andeanguides.com/index.php?t=10&cod=2 
 
Sam Walmsley - Provided us with some photos and very helpful advice on the Quimsa Cruz 
area.   
http://www.samwalmsley.co.uk/ 


